
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, July 28, 2015 6:06 PM 
To: Alireza Ittihadieh 
Subject: Re: AvJet BBJ 

i think larrry is attempting to set it up for mon , =o answer yet, . 

On Tue, Jul 28, 2015 at 1:45 PM, Alireza Ittihadieh < 
<mak° > wrote: 

You mentioned you wo=ld like to go and look at the AvJet BBJ July 30. 

=/span> 

BR 

A 

From: jeffrey =. [mailto:jeeva=ation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> I 
Sent: Tuesday, July 28, 2015 6:28 PM 
To: Alireza Ittihadieh 
Subject: Re: AvJet BBJ 

??? Is this for me 

On Tuesday, July 28, 2015, Alireza Ittihadieh < 

cmailtc > 

Are you still on for the viewing o= July 30? 

Best re=ards, 

=kong.com 

1=» wrote: 
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please no=e 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailtoleevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

please =ote 

The information contained in this communication is confiden=ial, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute 
inside informati=n, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the propert= of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or copying of this communica=ion or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If =ou have 
received this communication in error, please notify us immediat=ly by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail=com> , and destroy this comm=nication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -=11 rights reserved 
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