
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Thursday, July 23, 2015 4:28 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: Invoice for Pans Artwork 

no no art work just maybe tables from isreal artist<=r> 

On Thu, =ul 23, 2015 at 12:24 PM, Richard Kahn wrote: 

please confirm ok to purchase two pieces of art for 36,600 eur= plus shipping (which we are currently inquiring 
about) and that they will=be sent to 71st street 

thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

New York, NY 10022 

Begin forwarded message: 

-" ' • • ' ' • ' • px;margin-left:=px">From 

Subject: Invoice for Paris Artwork 

Date: 

To: Richard Kahn 

Cc: Bella Klein < 

Atta=hed is the invoice for two pieces of art Jeffrey would like to purchase. l=will also forward you his 
approval shortly. 

I am still waiting on ship=ing charges from the vendor. 
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=C2* please note 

The information contained in this communication =s 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute in=ide information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It =s the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of thi= 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be=unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please noti=y us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jee=acation@gmail.com> , and 
des=roy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachment=. copyright -all rights reserved 
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