Richard Kahn <[

From:

Sent: Monday, July 6, 2015 1:56 PM
To: jeffrey E.

Subject: Paul B

| spoke with Paul and he confirmed it was the countywide bond =hat was redeemed that he was referring to He said it
was =rading .94/.95 and they redeemed at par

Adjusted Cost Basis 838,309

Redemption Proceeds 897,774

Paul was very pleasant =nd frustrated by the lack of everything we are receiving at =B He offered to review remaining
positions we =till hold that he put on the books in addition to new positions added =y DB and give his input Please advise
if you would =ike me to send that to him Thank you

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington =venue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

On Jul 6, 2015, at 8:25 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote:

didnt we have a bond that just got called?

please note

The information contained in this =ommunication is
confidential, may be attorney-client =rivileged, may
constitute inside information, and is =ntended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the =roperty of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure =r copying of this
communication or any part thereof is =trictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have =eceived this
communication in error, please notify us =mmediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and
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destroy this =ommunication and all copies thereof,
including all =ttachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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