From: wireza ivodieh

Sent: Tuesday, July 14, 2015 5:50 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: RE: GV

Happy to help.

| will require a $75,000 Retainer and $175,000 Success fee.

If this work, | will send you my Exclusive Agreement.

Thank you & | look forward to your favourable reply.

ER

Alireza

From: jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com]
Sent: Tuesday, July 14, 2015 6:10 PM

To: Alireza Ittihadieh

Subject:

Im sorry for all the time wasted by both of us. . | need to buy a g5 for a client and would ask that you hanldle it. what
is the best on the market value etc

please note

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use,
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have
received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to
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jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com>, and destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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