
From: jeffrey E. < 
Sent: Wednesday, June 24, 2015 2:02 PM 
To: Jermaine 
Subject: Re: 

try 

On Wed, Jun 24, 2015 at 10:01 AM, Jermaine &=t <mailto 
wrote: 

Good day Boss, 

> > 

I will contact innovative to s=e why it is still ringing. The black weather box has the original 2 amps; =ower 
regulator; a digital processor/equalizer and mixer. 

- =C240 I was going o=er the build last night. Do you think an Integra pre amp like the flag pol= would make a 
difference we still have an old one (I play with the idea)? =u> 

=egards 

JRuan 

From: jeffrey E. [mailto <mailto > 
Sen=: Wednesday, June 24, 2015 9:34 AM 
To: Jermaine Ruan 
5=bject: 

775 8144, is still r=nging on line 1, in kitchen, thanks, .. is there a= amp in the tiki ? 

=C24, please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
co=fidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside inf=rmation, and is intended only for 
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the use of the addressee. It is the p=operty of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
com=unication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawfu.. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us im=ediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to <mailto:jeevacation=gmail.com> , and 
destroy thi= communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyr=ght -all rights reserved 

</=iv> 

ii,=A0 please note 

The information contained in this communication is<=r>confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute insid= information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is =he property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of thiscommunication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be un=awful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify =s immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to <mailto > , and 
destro= this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. =opyright -all rights reserved 
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