
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Monday, July 6, 2015 9:07 AM 
To: Stephen Hanson 
Subject: Re: Big thank you 

ive been asking for proposed destinationss will let you kn=w. 

On Mon, Jul 6, 2015 at 4:19 AM, Stephen Hanso wrote: 

=div>Anytime. When are u back in nyc. I'll drive in 
U think of a July trip at all ? 

Sent from my iPad 

O= Jul 5, 2015, at 7:27 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gma=l.com> wrote: 

thanks 

On Mon, Jul 6, 2015 at 1:24=AM, 
wrote: 

Dear Steve 
Thank you for making this weekend possible for us. We loved being at your v=ry special cottage. 

We locked everything up and put the key under the pot.=br> With love from all of us. 

Sent from my iPhone 

=div> 
please not= 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidentia=, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information,=and is intended only for 
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the use of the addressee. It is the property o= 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communicatio= or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you=have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately=by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.co=> , and 
destroy this communi=ation and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all=rights reserved 

=C2 please note 
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