From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com >

Sent: Tuesday, June 16, 2015 11:09 AM
To: Richard Kahn
Subject: Re: FW:

pay the tuition to the kids school . asap

==iv class="gmail_extra">

On Tue, Jun 16, 20=5 at 7:07 A, Richard kahn |

=rote:

Josch= is asking for 89,000
Please advise
Thank you

From: loscha Bach
Date: Tuesday, June 16, 2015 at 2:25 AM

To: Richard Kahn <

<=pan style="font-weight:bold">5ubject: Fwd:

<[=iv=>

Dear Richard,

Jeffrey tells me to send you my need list:

I will need some money fnr-chuol (he will enroll =n the German International School), and we have to
pay the tuition for the=year in June.-l.fill get into daycare this year. MIT has increased my s=lary, so it covers now
2/3 of our living expenses. Jeffrey's last donation kept us afloat until now; for=the next year we will need about 89.000.
(29K for tuition & daycare, 5= for traveling, 5K for hardware and some appliances, 27005 for car repairs=and about
39005 monthly deficit between salary and expenses for rent, food, healthcare.) Could you please help?

The wiring address is the usual one (MIT FCU),

=div=Bests,

Joscha

h
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please =ote

The information contained in this communication is confiden=ial, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute
inside informati=n, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the propert= of JEE Unauthorized use,
disclosure or copying of this communica=ion or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If =ou have
received this communication in error, please notify us immediat=ly by return e-mail or by e-mail to
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail=com:> , and destroy this comm=nication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -=Il rights reserved
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