
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Tuesday, June 16, 2015 8:20 PM 
To: Jeffrey E. 
Subject: Fwd: 

shall i pay 29,000 from enhanced to joscha as he seems to =ndicate his income levels help secure lower tuition costs 
please advise thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington =venue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel= 
fa 
cel 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: =/b>Joscha Bach 

To: qb>Richard Kah 

Cc: Mira Bac 

Subject: =/b>Re: 

Date: =/b>June 16, 2015 at 3:07:56 PM =DT 

We still =ave three weeks left to pay the second rate (paid the first one =lready). Mira (my wife) will send you 
the information. If we can make =t look as if the money comes from us instead from a corporate entity, =e the price will 
depend on our taxed income from last year. Tax returns =re not in yet, but we hope to get a substantial rebate. 

Bests, 
Joscha 

Am 16.06.2015 urn 13:32 =chrieb Richard Kahn 

jeffrey has asked that i pay Taiyo's school =mmediately 
can i pay German school directly 
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please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY =0022 
tel
fa 
cel 

On Jun 16, 2015, at 2:25 AM, Joscha Bad 

Dear Richard, 

Jeffrey tells me to send you my need list: 

=rote: 

I will need some money for Taiyo's school (he will enroll in =he German International School), 
and we have to pay the tuition for the =ear in June. Aino will get into daycare this year. MIT has increased my =alary, so 
it covers now 2/3 of our living expenses. Jeffrey's last =onation kept us afloat until now; for the next year we will need 
about =9.000. (29K for tuition & daycare, 5K for traveling, 5K for =ardware and some appliances, 2700$ for car repairs 
and about 3900$ =onthly deficit between salary and expenses for rent, food, healthcare.) =ould you please help? 

The wiring address is the usual one =MIT FCU). 

Bests, 

Joscha 

Joscha Bach, PhD 

MIT Media Lab: Playful Systems 
Harvard =niversity: Program for Evolutionary Dynamics 
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