
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, June 2, 2015 11:08 AM 
To: Ann Rodriquez; Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: Tiki Hut / Kalamazoo 

home depot please . and prices no later =hab tomor 

On Tue, Jun 2, 2015 at 7:06 AM, Ann Rodriquez rote: 

Please see link. 

Not sure if you would lik= to purchase new ones or fix The existing ones. 

E=ch cabinet cost about $3k-4k. 

Please advise, 
A=n R. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Ann Rodrique 
Date:</=> May 30, 2015 at 3:36:04 PM AST 
To: "jeffrey E." aa href="mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com" target="_blank">jeevacation@gmai=.com> 
Subject: Tiki Hut / Kalamazoo 

=/blockquote> 

I think the hardware used to as=emble the cabinets are not the same quality of the actual 
cabinets, becaus= only the inside of the drawers and cabinets are rusted and broken. <=div> 

Should we change all the hardware and just reassemble the existin= cabinets at the Tiki hut? 

http://kala=azoogourmet.com/products/cabinetry/storage-cabinets/ 
chttp://kalamazoogour=et.com/products/cabinetry/storage-cabinets/> 

=div> 

Ann R. 

<=div> 
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please note 

T=e information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be a=torney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is int=nded only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 

communication or any pa=t thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have recei=ed this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
retu=n e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmaitcom <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication an= all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights r=served 
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