
From: A. de Rothschild-2 a 
Sent: Thursday, June 4, 2015 9:09 AM 
To: Jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: 

Tell me when 

Ariane de Rothschild 

Le 4 juin 2015 a 11:08, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> a ecrit : 

yes, . that is one of the reasons to speak . 

On Thu, Jun 4, 2015 at 2:36 AM, A. de Rothschild-2 > wrote: 

I heard that the cousins paid 11.5mio to the Doj. Did u hear the same? 

Ariane de Rothschild 

Le 30 mai 2015 5 19:02, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» a ecrit : 

yves seemed surprised by the number though he had it under his control for months. he could 
have discovered whenver he wanted. thanks for the svet letter. my travel plans are being made tomorw lets talk 

please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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