
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Thursday, May 14, 2015 3:51 PM 
To: Ann Rodriquez 
Subject: Re: Little C: Mr. Hilaire 

Ok 

On Thursday, May 14, 2015, Ann Rodriquez wrote: 

Hey Bossman, 

Just confirming... 
Mr. Gerard Hilaire will repair little Cat Independent Boat Yard for $10,00=.00, Mr. Hilaire has agreed to start 

first thing Friday morning 5/15 from =am-7pm to guarantee his completion date of 3 weeks. 

1st Installment: $3,000.00 
Start date 5/15/2015 
2nd Installment: $2,500.00 
Inside hull is completed. 
3rd Installment: $2,500.00 
Outside damage repaired and completed. 

4th Bonus payment: $2,000.00 after 4 months of use to guarantee Job well do=e. 

Please advise, 
Ann R. 

=C2 please note 

The information contained in this co=munication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may c=nstitute inside 
information, and is intended only for the use of the ad=ressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, disclosure or 
co=ying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibitedand may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error,=please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com4=>, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, including =11 attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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