
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Monday, May 18, 2015 3:58 PM 
To: Ann Rodriquez 
Subject: Re: Saturday Landscapers 

ok 

On Mon, May 18, 2015 at 8:35 AM, Ann Rodriquez &l= 
wrote: 

Requesting $3166.00 Cash for Saturday Employees. 
Cr> 

Mr. Sainfrance worked 1 Saturday. 

Please adv=se, 
Ann R. 

On May 18, 2015, at 8:18 AM, jeffrey E. =lt;jeevacation@=mail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

500 cash each 

On Mon Ma 18 2015 at 8:08 AM, Ann Rodriquez 
> wrote: 

Hey =ossman, 

Chris, Dupson & Peter said I have not compensated them and their crew f=r 3 Saturday's. 

What would you like me to do? 

Peter 
Dupson 
Dalce 
Randy 
Onel 
Gerry 

Please advise, 
Ann R. 
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<=iv dir="ltr"> please note 
<=iv>The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may=be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and i= intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
J=E 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or a=y part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have =eceived this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communicationrand all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all right= reserved 

=/div>--

=C2 please note 

The information containe= in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileg=d, may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for the u=e of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disc=osure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly =rohibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
received this communicati=n in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail =o 
jeevacation@g=ail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
=ncluding all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

</=iv> 
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