
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, April 28, 2015 12:22 PM 
To: Brad Wechsler 
Subject: Fwd: PFS liabilities 

I have no idea. why what 6.6 or 6.5 is why it =ppears. ? explanation so far ludicrous 

 Forwarded message 
From: Eileen Alexanderson < <mailto > >= 
Date: Mon, Apr 27, 2015 at 6:05 PM 
Subject: PFS liabilities<=r>To: "jeffrey E." atevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» 

Numbers for outstanding balance on loans I quoted of= the top of my head were correct-PFS was done with 12/31/14 
balances rathe= than the normal 3/31 we have submitted in the past b/c B of A wants PFS e=rlier than usual. 

=AO =C2 =AO =C2 12/31/14 =A0 

Loan payable ART =C2 $470 mil =C2 =A0 

Loan payable BJAV =AO $17.3mi1 

Loan payable Plane =AO $21.0mil 

=AO =C2 =AO =C2 $508.3mi1 

On PFS, Rich added $6.6mi1 in 'accounts paya=le' bringing total to the $515mil you made mention of.</=> 

You will need to ask Rich to provide you with detail=on the A/P. 

Eileen Alexander=on 

Elysium Management<=> 

445 Park Avenue<=u> 

Suite 1401 

New York NY 10022 

Phone: <=> 

Email: 

EFTA_R1_01629667 
EFTA02501761



please note 

=he information contained in this communication is confidential, may be =ttorney-client privileged, may constitute 
inside information, and is in=ended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEEUnauthorized use, 
disclosure or copying of this communication or any p=rt thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
rece=ved this communication in error, please notify us immediately by ret=rn e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication an= all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights r=served 
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