From: wichard kahn <

Sent: Friday, May 1, 2015 5:55 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: Fwd: Resolve of outstanding balances due

please advise
thank you

Richard Kahn
HBRE Associates Inc.

Begin forwarded message:

From: =/b>Eric Roth <[ | G-
To: =/b>Richard Kahn <[
ce: Larry Visoski <[ G < - -

Subject: =/b>Re: Resolve of =utstanding balances due

Date: =/b>May 1, 2015 at 1:38:10 PM =DT

Hi Richard,
| am inguiring the status for final payment for the work =erformed on Jeffrey's Gulfstream?
As you are aware, we performed this work and have been =ue the outstanding balance for quite some time now.

Last | spoke with Jeffrey he was reviewing and then he =anted to enter into various discussions about a BBJ he
was / is =onsidering.

| would like this addressed as it is the respectful and =ight thing to do. We created a beautiful aircraft that JE
=njoys.

Best regards,

Eric
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Eric H. Roth, President
International =et Interiors

I |
On Mar 20, 2015, at 4:53 PM, Richard Kahn <[ G v ot-:

thank you for email
i will review next week when i am back in office
have a nice weekend

Richard Kahn
HBREK Associates Inc.

On Mar 18, 2015, at 1:17 PM, Eric Roth <[> ='ote:

Good afternoon Richard,

| have scrutinized each and every item on the summary invoice =hich identifies an outstanding
balance of $76,230.

These costs were already discounted due to my relationship with =effrey.

Although for the life of me | do understand why he wants to =nock down the price, but as much
as | care for leffrey, there are still =hings about him | just can’t explain — this being one of them.
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As a small business, this is real money that has an impact on =y business and is long overdue. |
believe that if | concede to =aking TEN THOUSAND DOLLARS (510,000.00) off the outstanding balance due, that | am
being far more than fair as = would like to get this resolved and put it past us.

Respectfully,

Eric

ERIC H. ROTH | PRESIDENT
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From: =ileen Craig

Sent: Wednesday, March 18, 2015 11:16 AM
To: Eric Roth

Subject: Summary for open items for JEGE

See attached
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EILEEN CRAIG | ACCOUNTING
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