From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com >

Sent: Wednesday, April 15, 2015 5:09 PM
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: Invoice N90BJE- WO 3801

ok

wrote:

please advise if ok to pay attached invoice for=27,824
thank you

Richard Kahn
HBREK Associates Inc.

New York, NY 10022

Begin forwarded message:

<=jy style="margin-top:0px:margin-right:0px:margin-bottom:0px;margin-left:=px">From: Larry <=a

href="mailt

Subject: <=pan style="font-family:-webkit-system-font,Helvetica Neue,Helvetica,sans=serif">Fwd:
Invoice NS0BJE- WO 3801

Date: April 10, 2015 at 2:42:4= PM EDT

L

Approved

JEGE=Inc

Maintenace items,.

Boca aircraft accept amsx, but c=arge 3.5%,. Seamed to much for additional charge,. Check via mail is
fine,=no rush

The high dollar item 525,000 was TCAS sys=em AD Mandatory upgrade.,.
TCAS is Traffic Collision Avoidance Sy=tem,. Keeps aircraft From midair collisions ,.
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Important item,.<=div=
Thx,.
Larry

=hr=Sent from my iPad

Begin forwarded message:

<=|lockquote type="cite">

From: Amber Barko (|| |GGG <--0D:t: April 10, 2015 at 1:32:20 PM EDT
To:
<==>Cc: Mike Robinson
Subject: Invoi=e N908JE- WO 3801

Good afternoon Larry,

Please find a=tached your invoice for N908JE for work order 3801, Let us know if you hav= any

guestions.
<f=>
Thank you very much,
Amber Barko
=/div>
=fdiv>
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=div class="gmail_signature">
©=A0 please note

The information contained in this commus=ication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
cons=itute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addre=see. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copyi=g of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
a=d may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, pl=ase notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, a=d
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all a=tachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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