
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, April 15, 2015 3:37 PM 
To: Larry Visoski 
Subject: Re: Synthetic vision GIV 

yes 

,On Wed, Apr 15, 2015 at 11:34 AM, Larry Visoski <I wrote: 

Jeffrey 
Synthetic vision upgrade for the GIV estimated first quarter 2016, installe=. 
Certification process is underway and savanna hopes for FAA approval 4Q/201= 
Price estimate 
$180k 

Thx 
Larry 

Sent from my iPhone 

please =ote 

The information contained in this communication is confiden=ial, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute 
inside informati=n, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the propert= of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or copying of this communica=ion or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If =ou have 
received this communication in error, please notify us immediat=ly by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail=com> , and destroy this comm=nication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -=11 rights reserved 
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