
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Monday, April 13, 2015 4:07 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: INVOICE NO. 15-001.1 

ok pay 

On Mon, Apr 13, 2015 at 12:05 PM, Richard Kahn 
wrote: 

=br> 
John woods submitted invoice f=r 5,000 for predesign and conceptual design phase 
we have paid 25k of =5k to date 
please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cel 

Begin forwarded message: 

<=iv style="margin-top:0px;margin-right:0px;margin-bottom:0px;margin-left:=px">Date: April 6, 
2015 at 4:15:=7 PM EDT 

Subject: <=pan style="font-family:-webkit-system-font,Helvetica 
Neue,Helvetica,sans=serif">Fwd: INVOICE NO. 15-001.1 

From: Daphne Wallace a > 

To: Rich Kahn <=a href="mailto; 
target="_blank"> 
<mailto: 

 Forwarded message 
Fr=m: "John P. Woods, AIA" <MMIII IMMI I" • > 
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Date: Apr 6, =015 4:08 PM 
Subject: INVOICE NO. 15-001.1 
To: "Daphne Wallace&q=ot; 
Cc: >,' Desiree M. 

Fran=is" < 

■ 
PLEASE FIND OUR P=Y REQUEST ATTACHED FOR A-E SERVICES FOR THE LITTLE ST. JAMES 

MAINTENANCE S=OP. 

THANKS, 

40=A0 

DMF 

FOR JPW 

<http://www.avast.com/> This email is free from viruses and malware because avast! Antivirus 
<http://w=w.avast.comi> protection is active. 

please=note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confide=tial, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside informat=on, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the proper=y of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communic=tion or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If=you have received this 
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communication in error, please notify us immedia=ely by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmai=.com> , and 
destroy this com=unication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright =all rights reserved 
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