From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, April 13, 2015 3:10 PM

To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: Meoteny 3, LP | Capital Call Notice
ok

On Mon, Apr 13, 2015 at 11:02 AM, Richard Kahn </NTRTRR DO - -

wrote:

attached is 1,000,000 capital call fo= Joi Ito fund Neoteny 3, LP due by April 16th
please advise if ok to s=nd from SFL LLC today
thank you

Richard Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.

New York, NY 10022

Begin forwarded message:

==iv style="margin-top:0px;margin-right:0px;margin-bottom:0px;margin-left:=px">5ubject:
Neoteny 3, LP | =apital Call Notice

From: <=b=Danielle Prague <Danielle@praguecpalaw.com
<mailto:Danielle@praguecpa=aw.com> >

Reply-To: Danielle Prague=<Daniell=@praguecpalaw.com
<mailto:Danielle@praguecpalaw.com> >

To: =/b>Richard Kahn <richardkahn12@gmail.com <mailto:richardkahnl12@gmail.=om> >

Date: April 10, 2015 at 12:03:1= PM EDT

<https://galler=.mailchimp.com/529537817a21c74ad 2eeB6334/images/546f1479-f0f8-4f56-9b8a-24=4642e684b.jpg>
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Neoteny 3, LP, cfo Neoteny 3 Management, LLC, ¢/o Prague &=mp; Company, P.C., Fifteen Walnut Street, Suite 150,
Wellesley, MA 02481=E2 Phone: +

Date: Apr 10, 2015

Investment: Neoteny 3, LP
Partner: Southern Financial, LLC
Your Role; Copy Contact

Re: Capital Call Due April 16, 2015
Amount Due: 51,000,000

Dear Richard Kahn:

Today, Neoteny 3, LP (the "Fund") is making a capital call in the=amount of 100% of each partner's subscribed interest,
as of the Initia= Closing Date (March 31, 2015).

=40 =br> According to our records, Southern Financial, LLC has subscribed for an int=rest of $1,000,000.
Therefore, the amount of this capital call is $1,000,0=0.

Pursuant to Article 6.1(b) and (c) of the Amended and Restated Limited Part=ership Agreement of the Fund, capital
contributions are due upon not less =han 10 Business Days from the date of written notice from the General Part=er of
such capital call. As such, the Fund requests that partners send the=r capital contribution by wire transfer or by check
(details below) at the=r earliest convenience, but no later than April 16, 2015.

For capital contributions being sent by wire, please follow the below instr=ctions:

For capital contributions being sent by check, please make checks payable t= "Neoteny 3, LP"
and mail to:

Meoteny 3, LP

cfo Neoteny 3 Management, LLC
cfo Prague & Company, P.C.

15 Walnut Street, Suite 150
Wellesley, MA 02481 USA

If you have any questions regarding this notice, please contact me by phune:a_
,or by e-mail at [
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Sincerely,
Danielle A. Prague, CPA

on behalf of Joichi Ito,
as manager of Neoteny 3 Management, LLC, the General Partner of Neoteny 3, LP

This email was sent to richardkahn12 @gmail.com

why did | get this? <http://ito.us6.list-

mana=el.com/about?u=529537817a21c74ad2ee86334 id=a081def4d5&e=cca=6dbal5&c=156f792d48> unsubscribe
from this list =C2 update subscription preferences <http://ito.usb.list-
manage2.com/profile?u=52953781=a21c74ad2ee86334&id=a08 1defdd5&e=eca7bdbals>

Meoteny 3, LP - Fifteen Walnut=5treet, Suite 150 : ¢/o Neoteny 3 Management, LLC, c/o Prague & C=mpany, P.C. -
Wellesley, MA 02481 - USA

<http://ito.us6.list-
manage.com/track/open.=hp?u=529537817a21c74ad2eeB6334&id=156f792d488&e=ecabdbal’5>

please=note

The information contained in this communication is
confide=tial, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside informat=on, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the proper=y of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communic=tion or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If=you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immedia=ely by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmai=.com>, and
destroy this com=unication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright =all rights reserved
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