
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, March 31, 2015 7:21 PM 
To: Eric Roth 
Subject: Re: Emailing: Pinto YG 120 Pre-Owned Blils 02_03_15.pdf 

iam asking for the invoice . not sure wh= this is still outstanding . 

On Tue, Mar 31, 2015 at 3:09 PM, Eric Roth wrote: 

Jeffrey, 

I have taken your participation into consi=eration when I prepared your invoice and provided a significant 
discount f=r the entertainment system, just trying to barely reach towards a break even point— at best. 

I am very confident that I provided you wi=h a great deal financially and to be 100% forthri ht and trans arent, 
my m=tivatio ' en by our business friendship and the hope that you could influence 
admissi=n to 

All this said, I went way above and beyond=the level of attention and service I provide to my best clients as I 
belie=e you and I have a long history and connection. 

When I told Richard I will take $10,000 of= the amount due, it still impacts a small business like mine — I a= not 
Gulfstream where $10,000 is just a rounding error. 

I would like to believe that you appreciat= our relationship and recognize that the invoice was fair and quite 
frankl=, generous. 

If for some reason you still have any doub=, then I am happy to go through the invoice with you, line by line.=u> 

Let me know how we should proceed?<=> 

EFTA_R1_01636149 
EFTA02506054



Best, 

Eric 

ERIC H. ROTH I PRESIDENT 

<http: www.in Je com > 

2221 Smithtown Avenue, Long Island Mac=rthur Airport, Ronkonkoma, New York 11779 

From: Jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.comj 
Sent: Tuesday, March 31, 2015 2:51 PM 
To: Eric Roth 
Subject: Re: Emailing: Pinto YG 120 Pre-Owned BBJs 02_03_15.pdf</=> 

how should you and I think about the fact that three=trips ,to islip, two charters to europe, and months of 
problems were=solely as a result of bad windows electric, etc. . stere= . should that be only my issue, . I have of 
course not reviewed the bills but i will if you like 

On Tue, Mar 31, 2015 at 2:36 PM, Eric Roth wrote: 
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$66,230 - after taking a $10k haircu= to make you happy 

ERIC H. ROTH I PRESIDENT 

<mailto < ttp: www.int jet.com > = u> 

2221 Smithtown Avenue, Long Island Mac=rthur Airport, Ronkonkoma, New York 11779 

From: Jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.c=m] 
Sent: Tuesday, March 31, 2015 2:34 PM 
To: Eric Roth 
Subject: Re: Emailing: Pinto YG 120 Pre-Owned BBJs 02_03_15.pdf 

how much is your syrancsue payment? 

On Tue, Mar 31, 2015 at 2:33 PM, Eric Roth -=wrote: 

Hey, we never discussed the money that you=owe me and I have next years Syracuse payment 
coming due.=/u> 

Can you do me a favor and call my friend R=chard to release payment before Passover? 
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ERIC H. ROTH I PRESIDENT 

<http://www.intljet.com/> =/u> 

2221 Smithtown Avenue, Long Island Mac=rthur Airport, Ronkonkoma, New York 11779 

From: Jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.c=mi 
Sent: Tuesday, March 31, 2015 2:24 PM 
To: Eric Roth 
Subject: Fwd: Emailing: Pinto YG 120 Pre-Owned BBJs 02_03_15.pdf 

 Forwarded message 
From: Alireza lttihadieh 
Date: Thu, Mar 26, 2015 at 7:23 PM 
Subject: Emailing: Pinto YG 120 Pre-Owned BBJs 02_03_15.pdf 
To: "jeevac=tion@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> " <jeevacation@gmail.com 

<mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» 

Attached another Pinto Aircraft, you could perhaps look at the Floorplan an= convert 006. 

We are in the final stages of the the Break up, but I thought it was worth =howing you this. 

BR 
Alireza 
Your message is ready to be sent with the following file or link attachment=: 

Pinto YG 120 Pre-Owned BBJs 02_03_15.pdf 

Note: To protect against computer viruses, e-mail programs may prevent send=ng or receiving 
certain types of file attachments. Check your e-mail=security settings to determine how attachments are handled.<=p> 
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please no=e 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client 
privileged, may 

constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

please no=e 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

please no=e 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
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including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

please =ote 

The information contained in this communication is confiden=ial, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute 
inside informati=n, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the propert= of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or copying of this communica=ion or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If =ou have 
received this communication in error, please notify us immediat=ly by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail=com> , and destroy this comm=nication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -=11 rights reserved 
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