
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Friday, April 10, 2015 8:25 PM 
To: bellaklein 
Subject: Re: 

yes 

On Fri, Apr 10, 2015 at 3:24 PM, bellaklein =lt > wrote: 

Jeffrey, 
Please confirm payment to Dr. Magnani for Simon in the amount of $4,207. In=oice attached. 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

ple=se note 

The information contained in this communication is conf=dential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute 
inside infor=ation, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the pro=erty of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or copying of this commu=ication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.=If you have 
received this communication in error, please notify us imme=iately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@g=ail.com> , and destroy this =ommunication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyrig=t -all rights reserved 
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