
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Saturday, March 28, 2015 6:53 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: 

yes 

On Sat, Mar 28, 2015 at 2:53 PM, Richard Kahn 
wrote: 

please advise if ok to send 21,600 to jen =nd karyna DB account for rent and telephone for 2015 

re=t 1500 x 12 = 18,000 
=div>at&t telephone 300 x 12 3,600 

total 21,60= 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

New York, NY 10022 

Begin forwarded message: 

<=iv styleemargin-top:0px:margin-right:0px:margin-bottom:0px:margin-left:=px">From: 
bellaklein 

Subj=ct: Rent 2015 

Date: March 27, 2015 at 4:41:53 =M EDT 

To: Richard Kahn 

Jen=is here and asking for 8H rent and telephone expenses for 2015 January - D=cember. Rent is 
approximately $1500 and telephone $300. Total $1800 per mo=th and $21,600 for 2015. The last time she was 
reimbursed was over a year =go. I am looking for the backup..but don't see it. 
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Thank you, 
B=I la 

please note 

The=information contained in this communication is confidential, may be att=rney-client privileged, may constitute 
inside information, and is inten=ed only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE U=authorized use, 
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part=thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
receive= this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return=e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and al= copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reser=ed 
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