From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, March 30, 2015 11:57 AM
To: W. Mark Lloyd
Subject: Re: Euro

Kiss is a story teller that can't get rid of the=house. he said he turned down 48 million from HBJ. =C2€» i know its bull.
he said the price was now 60, as he heard it=was me.

Sent from my iPhone

On 30 Mar 2015, at 12:04, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeev=cation@gmail.com> > wrote:

nono how=are you, the owner of hte marrakash house contacted me a=d told me the turkish
architect is not authorized to show or be involved.=C24p strange

On Mon, Mar 30, 2015 at 6:49 AM, W. Mark Lioyd _

Hi Jeffr=y,

Just wondered if our friend sorted out his exposure to the Euro? Were you a=le to help?
As ever,

Mark

Sent from my iPhone

please note

The information contained in this communication is
confidential, m=y be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and=is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or=any part thereof is strictly prohibited
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and may be unlawful. If you hav= received this

communication in error, please notify us immediately by<=r=return e-mail or by e-mail to
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and

destroy this communicati=n and all copies thereof,

including all attachments. copyright -all rig=ts reserved

=C24¢ please note

The information contained in this co=munication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may

c=nstitute inside information, and is intended only for

the use of the ad=ressee. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or co=ying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibitedand may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error,=please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com</==, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,

including =l attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

EFTA_R1_01637155
EFTA02506803



