From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Sent: Sunday, March 29, 2015 4:36 PM
To: Brad Wechsler
Subject: Re:

a good question to be answered after all the info is in

On Sun, Ma= 29, 2015 at 12:34 PM, Brad WEEhSIE_:pan::- wrote:

Jeffrey-as you know | am try=ng clean up the records and administration of all the inter-entity notes. =istorically,
the notes have been either written with interest "compou=ded annually” or "paid annually”. | would like to put all t=e
notes on annual cash pay and clean up (retire) some of the smaller notes=

First, any problem in going to cash pay on interest. Seems prudent, correct=B

Sent from my Verizon Wireless BlackBerry

please =ote

The information contained in this communication is confiden=ial, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute
inside informati=n, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the propert= of JEE Unauthorized use,
disclosure or copying of this communica=ion or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If =ou have
received this communication in error, please notify us immediat=ly by return e-mail or by e-mail to
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail=com> , and destroy this comm=nication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -=Il rights reserved
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