From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com >

Sent: Saturday, March 28, 2015 7:56 PM
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: ZDC Hydro-seeder

Yes

confirming per B=ice it is ok to purchase a hydroseeder attached estimate is 4,295 befo=e tax and possible shipping cost
i will compare on monday agains= vendor we used for LS) please confirm ok to purchase with a 4,8=0 maximum cost

Richard Kahn
HBREK Associates Inc.

New York, NY 10022

Begin forwarded message:

<=iv style="margin-top:0px;margin-right:0px:margin-bottom:0px;margin-left:=px">Date: March 25, =015 at
2:09:10 PM EDT

Subject: ZDC Hydro-seeder

To: Rich Kahn <<= href:“javascriptr_e[%?E%?D,‘cuml'_

<=iv style="margin-top:0px;margin-right:0px;margin-bottom:0px;margin-left:=px">Cc: I EGTTEGGIN

Rich

As Discussed, attached =nfo for your consideration

this is what | have come up with rega=ding the purchase of a hydroseeder for the Ranch

this does not i=clude the material and seed.

If JEE wish to pursue this, we woul= need to have unit and material on site by the end of April if possible
let me know how you wish to proceed

EFTA_R1_01637380
EFTA02506969



Brice Gordon<=h>
Stanley, NM

please note

The=information contained in this communication is confidential, may be att=rney-client privileged, may constitute
inside information, and is inten=ed only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE U=authorized use,
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part=thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have
receive= this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return=e-mail or by e-mail to
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and al= copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reser=ed

EFTA_R1_01637381
EFTA02506970



