From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Sent: Sunday, March 8, 2015 8:53 AM
To: I
Subject: Re: Receipts

stephen. send what you think is fair. €=A0 | set aside the time that you told me you needed. €=A0 | certainly don't
want to profit from your delay, . That bei=g said, | look forward to the next movie DO =ot send faces..

On sun, Mar 8, 2015 at 5:39 AM, |, - -

wrote:

This came today from Bruce's producer. Do you have a s=appy reply | could give that lets him know that | want
the full amount for=the week (which he said, "don’t worry, we'll pay you for the =eek" when he told me it was canceled
and to go home).

Begin forwarded message:

From: Stephen
Date: March 7, 2015 at 3:53:56 P= PST

To: I

Subject: =b>Re: Receipts

Hey=

I'm counting work days Sunday, Monday, Tuesday, We=nesday
53,500.00 per week

52,000.00 pro rated

You good with that?

SE

Stephen Eads
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on Mar 6, 2015, at 2:23 pv, | IR - - .-

Happy w=ekend!

On Mar &, 2015, at 9:32 AM, Stephen =br>

wrote:

h=pe you've been well-

yes, of course

==

Stephen Eads
<=iv style="font-size:12px">

on Mar 6, 2015, at 11:18 AM, || G - v rote:

If so,=would you had me back?

On Mar &, 2015, at 7:31 AM, Stephen=Eads < wrote:

possible rest=rt on March 23 ... we shall see

Stephen
=/div>

on war 6, 2015, at 10:30 v | -

Good m=rning Stephen,
| just resent it.
So0= has the movie definitely been canceled? Anything else coming up soon? |
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On Mar &, 2015, =t 6:58 AM, Stephen

Invoices h=ve been sent to accountant.

| didn’t see the 5465.0= charge from United for changing your reservation.

Stephen
=/div>

on reb 27, 2015, at :27 e, | - -

_

wrote:

On Feb 27, 2015, at 7:21 AM, Stephen Eads <>=wrote:

where do | send the check?

Stephen Eads
<=iv style="font-size:12px">

wrote:

Thank=you.
L=

On Feb 26, 2015, at 6:51 PM, Stephen Eads <wrote:<=r>

| will take care of all of this
=br>
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wrote:

Stephen Eads
<=iv style="font-size:12px">

on Feb 26, 2015, at 6:33 v,

Hi Stephen,
These a=e yesterday's receipts, in case you need them. After mechanical

malfun=tion, missed planes and delays, | finally made it home at midnight last ni=ht!

| wish | had gotten to see you guys. Please let me kno= if you need me to

invoice you for my week's wages and per diem or whe=her you have that covered.

the property of

Please stay in touch.

Hogs NN

<IMG_2168.JPG>

<=div>

<=blockquote=

#=A0 please note

The information=contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client=privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for=br>the use of the addressee. Itis

JEE

Unauthorized =se, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is =trictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
co=munication in error, please notify us immediately by
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return e-mail or b= e-mail to jeev=cation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com=,
and

destroy this communication and all copies the=eof,

including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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