From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com >

Sent: Monday, March 9, 2015 7:31 PM
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: Better Roads

yes

On Mon, Mar 9, 2015 at 3:30 PM, Richard Kahn richardka=n12@gmail.com cmailtu:—:- = wrote:

i was able to get jeffers down to 512,500 f=om 525,000
please advise if i have your approval to giv= them 1/3 deposit of 170,833.33
thank you

Richard Kahn
HBREK Associates Inc.

New York, NY 10022

On Mar &, 2015, at 4:20 PM, jeffrey=E. <jeevacat=on@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> >
wrote:

ok

On Fri, Mar 6, 2015 =t 10:20 PM, Richard Kahn <{i NN
<mailt i > r-te:

=poke with jeffers today and bid him 500k vs 525k quote

he said he woul= come back to me monday..

Richard Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.

New York, NY 10022
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On Mar 5, 2015, at 2:53 PM, jeffrey=E. <jeevacat=on@gmail.com
=mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> > wrote:

Negotiate

On=Thursday, March 5, 2015, Richard Kahn _

< N > ' Ote:

regardi=g june 15th start for better roads anna and daphne have begun to make
prev=sions

total price of 525,000 - the last discussio=s we had were about attempting to lower cost
of job due to decrease in fue= prices...

i am concerned that if i send 1/= deposit of 175,000 i will lose ability to negotiate at a
later date

=div>please advise if i shall send funds or attempt to negotiate 525,000 co=t

thank you

Richard Kahn
HBREK Associates Inc.

New York, NY 10022

On Mar 1, 2015, at 6:33 AM, jeffrey=E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote:

lets plan on june 15 to start road project. pay deposit. ge=topo for engieering.
we should set aside a wash bay for all e=uipment. pressure wash, drains etc.

please n=te

The information contained in this communication is
confident=al, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside informatio=, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property=of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
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communicat=on or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If y=u have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediate=y by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and

including all attach=ents. copyright -all rights reserved

please note

T=e information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be a=torney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is int=nded only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

JEE

communication or any pa=t thereof is strictly prohibited

and may be unlawful. If you have recei=ed this

communication in error, please notify us immediately by

retu=n e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com: , and
destroy this communication an= all copies thereof,

including all attachments, copyright -all rights r=served

=AD please note

The information contained in this communicati=n is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute=inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. =tis the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of =his
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may=be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please n=tify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:=eevacation@gmail.com> , and
=estroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachm=nts. copyright -all rights reserved
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=C2 please note

The information co=tained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client pr=vileged, may constitute
inside information, and is intended only for

JEE

Unauthorized use= disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is str=ctly prohibited and may be
unlawful. If you have received this commu=ication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e=mail to
jeevaca=ion@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all copies thereo=,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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