
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, March 10, 2015 1:56 PM 
To: bellaklein 
Subject: Re: Wires 

Yes 

On Tuesday, March 10, 2015, bellaklein wrote: 

Jeffrey, 
Please confirm 3 wires requested b 
2500 Euros to 2500 Euros to and 1000 Euros to =. 

Thank you, 
Bella 
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