
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, February 25, 2015 2:47 PM 
To: bellaklein 
Subject: Re: Invoice Mount Sinai 

yes 

On Wed, Feb 25, 2015 at 10:17 AM, > wrote: 

Jeffrey, 
Attached please find invoice from Mo=nt Sinai for Juggly surgery in the amount of $2900. Please confirm 

payment= 

Thank you, 
Bella 

CS 

Begin forwarded message: 

<=iv style="margin-top:0px;margin-right:0px;margin-bottom:0px;margin-lefti=px">From:"Marg=lin, 

Hi Bella 

Attached is the other outstanding invoice we spoke abo=t. 
jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copi=s thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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