
From: 
Sent: Thursday, March 8, 2018 11:57 PM 
To: Jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: 

My dear Jeffrey, 

Im so sorry for a dela=ed response, I saw your email this morning and then got lost in my work.</=iv> 

The ceo of Liaigre has asked me to do their CAD wor=, over and above what I am doing, and has asked me to propose an 
hourly ra=e that I will be paid. They do not have anyone in the US that is solely re=ponsible for this at the moment. 

I met with a man=at Andrew Farkas's designers (Daniel Romueldez) office - Steven - I re=lly liked him but he says they 
don't exactly have a position open but =anted to meet me anyway. He was a little concerned with the international 
=hing and how they would keep me on after the fall if I were to work with t=em. 

I am applying to jobs posted to Parsons and o= Linkedin, ones that would offer more than Liaigre does. 
ar> 

What I wanted to ask is: 

1. Whether =e should decrease what you give me by at least the amount of what Liaigre =ill give me for my drafting so 
that I am taking less from you 2. As I have 3-4 days off every alternate weekend (when I am n=t at whitney) could it be 
helpful if I go and work for, and help ifsisson =b>LSJ on these days? I could also cancel the Whitney if it could be 
he=pful to you. 

I love you always 

On Wed, Mar 7, 2018 at 6:38 PM, jeffrey E. &l=;jeevacation@gm=il.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» wrote: 

job? 

=C2 please note 

The informat=on contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-cli=nt privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only =or 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthoriz=d use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof =s strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 

return e-mail o= by e-mail to j=evacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
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destroy this communication and all copies =hereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
</=iv> 
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