From: Richard Kahn I

Sent: Monday, February 23, 2015 4:00 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: Fwd: Chrome Book order

just spoke with Cecile and Darren and they stated that STC =as a 50,000 annual charitable requirement is invoice in =he
amount of 42,621 ok to pay from STC or do you prefer =nhanced please advise thank =ou

Richard Kahn
HBRE Associates Inc.

575 Lexington =venue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

Begin forwarded message:
Date: =/b=February 18, 2015 at 1:11:05 PM =5T
Subject: =/b=Re: Chrome Book =rder

From: =/b>"jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com:

yes

On Wed, Feb 18, 2015 at 1:03 PM, Richard Kahn =span dir="Itr" class:"">_wrutez

is attached =rder in the amount of 42,621 to be paid from STC or Enhanced
please advise
thank you

Date: February 18, 2015 at 1:00:46 PM =5T
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Subject: Re: Chrome Book =rder

OK, no problem. FY| - =E wants to donate these to a charity or school. We have yet to =dentify
the entity. This will go towards our charitable =iving.

With warm =egards,
Cecile

On Wednesday, February 18, 2015 1:50 PM, =ichard Kahn_

thank you for details

if =nvoice is ready to be paid please process and include in package to =Y
thanks

Richard =ahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

Richard Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington =venue 4th Floor
Mew York, NY 10022

="+12129711306" target="_blank" :|355:"-'_

Begin forwarded message:

Date: =/b>February 18, 2015 at 10:47:04 AM =5T
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Reply-To: =/b>Cecile de Jong
To: =/b>Richard ahn |
Cc: =/b=leanne Erennnn_

Subject: =/b>Re: Chrome Book =rder

Rich,
| have =ttached the comparison sheet that Jermaine provided which | shared with =E. Je chose

the Acer Chrome. | have also attached the =nvoice from Liston.

With warm regards,
Cecile

= On Wednesday, February 18, 2015 11:39 =M, Richard Kahn _

can you please forward =roposal from liston
thanks

Richard Kahn

HBRE =ssociates Inc.

575 Lexington =venue 4th Floor
MNew York, NY 10022

eb 17, 2015, at 10:37 AM, =ecile de Jongh ||| GGG
> wrote:

Hi =iston,
We are getting the check cut for you. We should have it =n a few days.
With warm regards,

Cecile

EFTA_R1_01641668
EFTA02510081



Sent from =y iPhone and misspellings courtesy of iPhone.

On Feb 17, 2015, at 11:37 AM, =iston J. Thoma—
I - o'

Good day to all, I'm following up on the Deposit =tatus for the (100) Chrome Book Device order.

=fdiv=

please note

The information contained in this =ommunication is
confidential, may be attorney-client =rivileged, may
constitute inside information, and is =ntended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the =roperty of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure =r copying of this
communication or any part thereof is =trictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have =eceived this
communication in error, please notify us =mmediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and
destroy this =ommunication and all copies thereof,
including all =ttachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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