
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Monday, February 23, 2015 4:06 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: Chrome Book order 

stc 

On Mon, Feb 23, 2015 at 11:59 AM, Richard Kahn 
wrote: 

just spoke with Cecile and Darren and the= stated that STC has a 50,000 annual charitable requirement 
is invoice=in the amount of 42,621 ok to pay from STC or do you prefer enhanced 
=div>please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

New York, NY 10022 

Begin forwarded message: 

<=iv style="margin-top:0px;margin-right:0px;margin-bottom:0px;margin-left:=px">Date: February 1=, 
2015 at 1:11:05 PM EST 

Subject: Re: Chrome Book order 
=/div> 
From: &q=ot;jeffrey E." <To: <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> Richard Kahn 

yes 

On Wed, Feb 18, 2015 at 1:03 PM, =ichard Kahn 
> wrote: 

is attac=ed order in the amount of 42,621 to be paid from STC or Enhanced 
thank you 
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Date: </=pan>February 18, 2015 at 1:0O:46 PM EST 

From: Cecile de Jongh 

Reply-To: Cecile de Jongh 

To: Richard Kahn 

Cc: Jeanne Br=nna 

Subject: Re: Chrome Book order</=> 

OK, no problem. FYI - JE wants to donate th=se to a charity or school. We have yet to identify 
the entity. =This will go towards our charitable giving. 

With wa=m regards, 
Cecile 

On Wednesday,=February 18, 2015 1:50 PM, Richard Kah 
MilagailiallS

t>
i wrote: 

thank you for details 
if invoice is r=ady to be paid please process and include in package to NY 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Flo=r 
New York, NY 10022 

</=iv> 
Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

New York. NY 10022 
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Begin forwarded message: 

<=iv style="margin-top:0px;margin-right:0px;margin-bottom:0px;margin-left:=px">Date: 
February 18, 2015 at 1=:47:04 AM EST 

From: Cecile de Jongh 

Reply-To: Cecile de Jongh 

To: Richard Kahn <richardkahn12@gmail.co 

Cc: Jeanne Brennan <jabwcpa@gmail.com 

Subject: Re: Chrome Book o=der 

</=iv> 
Rich, 

I have attached the comparison sheet that Jermaine provided whi=h I shared with JE. Je 
chose the Acer Chrome. I have also atta=hed the invoice from Liston. 

With warm regards, 
Cecile 
<=iv> 

On Wednesday, February 18, 2015 11:39 AM, Richard Kahn 
> wrote: 

can you =lease forward proposal from liston 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
=75 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

On Feb 17, 2015= at 10:37 AM, Cecile de Jongh <ceciledejongh@yahoo.co= 
<mailto:ceciledejongh@yahoo.co=> wrote: 
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Hi Liston, 

<=div> 
We are getting the check cut for you. We should have it in = few days. 

With warm regards, 

Cecile 

Sent from my iPhone and misspellings courtesy of iPhone. 
<=div> 

On Feb 17, 2015, at 11:37 AM, Liston J. Thomas 
> wrote: 

-r clear="none"> 
Good day to a=l, I'm following up on the Deposit status for the (100) Chrome Boo= 

Device order. 

=br> 

<=iV> 

ablockquote> 

=C240 please note 

The informat=on contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-cli=nt privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only =or 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthoriz=d use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof =s strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 

return e-mail o= by e-mail to j=evacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> 
, and 

destroy this communication and all copies =hereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
</=iv> 
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=C240 please note 

The information co=tained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client pr=vileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 

JEE 
Unauthorized use= disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is str=ctly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
commu=ication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e=mail to jeevaca=ion@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereo=, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

</=iv> 
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