From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com >

Sent: Thursday, March 12, 2015 8:17 PM
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: Svet apt renavation

583

On Thu, Mar 12, 2015 at 3:50 PM, Richard Kahn

Subject: 11 P invoice

Date: March 12, 2015=at 11:01:12 AM EDT

ce: Cecille Matela <

Hi Rich,

Enclosed is the invoice for 11P. =It looks like there are two apartments remaining.. 8H and 3M - we will do =he kitchens
and 3M will do some bath room work 8H has a large kitchen.=C2 None of these will require major elecric or appliances
so the prices=for each should be around $15-518K.

Thanks
=br=
Begin forwarded message:

<=iv style="margin-top:0px;margin-right:0px;margin-bottom:0px;margin-left:=px">From: Anthony Ba=rett

-

=b=5ubject: 11 P invoice

=<=pan style="font-family:-webkit-system-font,Helvetica Neue,Helvetica,sans=serif;color:rgba(0,0,0,1.0)">Date:
March 12, 2015 a= 11:01:12 AM EDT

c=: Cecille Matela < . -

Hi Rich,

Enclosed is the=invoice for 11P. It looks like there are two apartments remaining.. =H and 3M - we will do the
kitchens and 3M will do some bath room work
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8= has a large kitchen. None of these will require major elecric or ap=liances so the prices for each should be
around 515-518K.

Thanks

Anthony Barrett

please note
The information contained in this communication is
confidential, =ay be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, an= is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication o= any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you ha=e received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by=br>return e-mail or by e-mail to
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com>, and
destroy this communicat=on and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all ri=hts reserved
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