
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Sunday, January 25, 2015 9:07 PM 
To: Brad Wechsler 
Subject: Re: Follow-up 

phone 

On Sun, Jan 25, 2015 at 4:45 PM, Brad Wechsler wrote: 

A coup=e of things I forgot to mention: 
1. I want to confirm that the 1/2 dozen or so intra family notes that compo=nd annually should be amended to 

annual cash pay. I also want to confirm t=at you want the interest rates somewhat higher than the AFR safe har=or 
rates. 

2. I plan to institute quarterly meetings between the Trustees and benefici=ries where they will be provided (by 
the trustees) a quarterly update on t=e trust assets. This will also be a forum for general discussion between t=ustees 
and beneficiaries. At some point we may also invite relevant guests=for part of the meeting presenting on topics of 
interest or relevance. Fro= my perspective Leon should obviously attend as well. Should there be an e=ecutive session 
between trustees and beneficiaries? (No me, no leon) 

3. I want to push the internal team to do all relevant administration for a=t partnership and Nar. Anything going 
on why I shldnt push. (I know we may=fund/contribute assets incrementally). 

4. 1 plan to keep Elysium Ilc as owned and funded (overhead) by leon. Any i=sues? I am also going to be 
appointed a managing director (with leon) so 1=can sign for the office. 

Let's discuss the above as relevant. B 

www.imax.com <http://www.imax.com> 
IMAX* is a registered trademark of IMAX Corporation. 

IMPORTANT NOTICE*** ******** *************** ****** 
Information contained in this e-mail correspondence and any attachments is =onfidential information intended 

only for the use of the individual or ent=ty named above. 
Any reader of this message who is not the intended recipient of this corres=ondence is hereby notified that any 

dissemination, distribution, copying or communication of the contents of this correspondence is strictly prohibi=ed. If 
this e-mail was not addressed to you , please immediately notify us=br> by phone in Canada at (905) 403-6500 
<tel:%28905%29%20403-6500> (collect calls will be accepted) or by email at <= 
href="mailto:webmaster@imax.com">webmaster@imax.com and delete and =estroy this 

correspondence inadvertently sent to you. Thank you 

please =ote 
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The information contained in this communication is confiden=ial, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute 
inside informati=n, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the propert= of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or copying of this communica=ion or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If =ou have 
received this communication in error, please notify us immediat=ly by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail=com> , and destroy this comm=nication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -=11 rights reserved 
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