From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com >

Sent: Thursday, January 29, 2015 11:23 AM
To: I
Subject: Re: Dr Magnani

of course wehere ar e you

wrote:

Dear Jeffrey , Magn=ni sent the office this invoice. It is 5645 total and was for me to have m= teeth cleaned and
a filling redone. Would it be ok for Bella to pay it?</=iv>
Thank you xo

Sent from my iPhone

Begin=forwarded message:

Date: January 28, 2015 at 8:50:57 PM G=T

To: | - -

Subject: Dr=Magnani

Bl p'ease confirm your visit and procedure with =r. Magnani. Please provide JE approval.

Thank you,
<=jyv=Bella

—qmailmz_}
Tel: =a href="te!: | GGG value:"+_' target:"_hlank"_

Begin forwarded message:

<=iv style="margin-top:0px;margin-right:0px;margin-bottom:0px;margin-left:=px">To:

Subject: Message from KMBT_C253
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rror: [

</f=iv=>
Reply-To: <= href="

target="_blank"=>

=ate: January 28, 2015 at 3:21:31 PM EST

=djv=

=C24)p please note

The information contained in this co=munication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may

c=nstitute inside information, and is intended only for

the use of the ad=ressee. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or co=ying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibitedand may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error,=please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com</=>, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,

including =ll attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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