
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, January 14, 2015 9:11 PM 
To: Brad Wechsler 
Subject: Re: Taxes 

ok 

On Wed, Jan 14, 2015 at 4:20 PM, Brad Wechsler > wrote: 

Hi- Jef=rey, Confirmed barry has the authority. (See below). Btw, its Idb 2014, no= 2011 (my error). We're teed 
up to move the $$ but want to make certai= you're comfortable. B 

Sent from my Verizon Wireless BlackBerry 

 Ori:inal Messa:e--
From: 

To: Jeffrey Epstein<jeeyacation=gmail.com <mailtoleevacation@gmail.com» 
Reply-To 
Cc: Richard Joslin >; Eileen 

Alexarlderson 
Subject: Taxes 

I believe we can have the full federal estimate paid tomorrow out of leon a=d deb's joint acct IF leon borrows 
$6mm out of $12mm in Idb 2011 Ilc=C2 (owned by the trusts). I am confirming I need one approval (barry co=en, mgr of 
the Ilc). I presume this is choice 1. Pls confirm. I assume cho=ce 2, while not likely, is to pay the full $21mm federal 
estimate on 1/24 =ather than piecemeal it out. Correct? Pls call or email with observations =r concerns. B 

Sent from my Verizon Wireless BlackBerry 

please =ote 

The information contained in this communication is confiden=ial, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute 
inside informati=n, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the propert= of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or copying of this communica=ion or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If =ou have 
received this communication in error, please notify us immediatrly by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail=com> , and destroy this comm=nication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -=11 rights reserved 
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