
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Thursday, March 8, 2018 12:17 AM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: FBI Floor Vendor for Master, Chillax, Gym and Library 

cababns? 

On Wed, Mar 7, 2018 at 5:43 PM, Richard Kahn <rich=rdkahnl2@gmail.com <mailto:richardkahn12@gmail.com» 
wrote: 

attached is quote broken down by area,=materials and labor 
master bedroom pricing seems out of line..and i wi=I call tomorrow to negotiate.. 

master materials f=r 1,000 sq ft = 76,670 
estimating 26,670 of material pre= costs then cost per sq ft is still $50 for 7" widths 
th=s compares to Chillax material (see quote below) of $14.23 per sq ft for 5=E24,4> widths 

i was told they would like to beg=n work April 1st and finish no later than May 4th 
they will brin= down a 2-3 man installation crew and then 2 finishers for master which wi=l need 3 applications 
materials from master will be ordered from=holland and take 1 week to arrive in FL 
if we want to use =ame material for cabanas 1-4 we will need to decide asap so that 1,654 add=tional square 

footage can be ordered as well.. 

pl=ase advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th =Ioor 
New York, NY 10022 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Richard Moyer <Richard@=wbr>absolutehardwoodflooring.com> 
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Subject: RE: contact info for=master bedroom floors 

Date: March 7, 2018 at 3:36:30 PM EST 

To: Ri=hard Kahn «mailt >, Luis Ramos 

Cc= Brice Gordon , Daphne Wallace 
gt; 

=div style="margin:0in 0in 0.0001pt;font-size:12pt;font-familyfTimes=New Roman',serir>Richard, 

Attached is a revised proposal including labor/materials broken =ut. Our quote is based on HBRK 
providing all transportation and housing ac=omadations. 

=/u> 
As always reac= out with any questions. 
=span style="font-size:11pt;font-family:Calibri,sans-serif;color:rgb(31,7=,125)"> 
Bes= regards, 
=C2* 
Richard Moyer I 

From: Richard Kahn (mailt 
Se=t: </=pan>Wednesday, March 07, 2018 9:00 AM 
To: Luis Ramos Richard Moyer 

cmailtca 
Subj=ct: <=span>Re: contact info for master bedroom floors 
=/div> 

thank you for the follow up Luis 
we need more details on the quote breaking down each area wit= materials and labor cost 
in addition did your quote include travel cost? 
please advise 
=div style="margin:0in 0in 0.0001pt;font-size:12pt;font-familyfTimes=New Roman',serir>thank you 

Richard K=hn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th F=oor 
New York. NY 10022=/u> 

=/u> 
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On Feb 26, 2018, at 3:33 AM, Brice Gordon O. wrote: 

Good Morning Luis 

an= updates reference travel this week? 
please advise 

regards=Brice 

t 3:59 PM, Luis Ramos &=t 
wrote: 

Brice, 

If we land =t 12:40 pm and fly out at 5:20 pm will that be enough time? 

LUIS RAMOS JR.=C240l V.P. of Sales & Marketing 
1241-B Old Okeechobee <https://maps.goog=e.com/?q=1241-

B+Old+Okeechobee%Cr/0A0%7C%C2%A0V0C2%A0West+Palm+Beach,+FL+3=401&entry=gmail&source=g> I West Palm 
Beach, FL 33401 

On Feb 22, 2018, a= 11:38 AM, Brice Gordon «mailtc 
as discussed =ttached, 
Floor Plan f=r Master Bedroom 
Mast=r tub is situated on the back wall not against steam room 
Confirming you will be laying flooring=material only 
We will=need to lay vapor barrier and subfloor correct, or can you perform this 

wo=k as well? 
430=A0 
regards Brice</=> 

<=iv> 

On =hu, Feb 22, 2018 at 12:08 PM, Richard Kahn 
wrote: 

proposed visit date: Wednesday February 28, 2018 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
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575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
<https://m=ps.google.comllq=575+Lexington+Avenue+4th+Floor+%0D+New+York,+NY+10022&a=p;entry=gmail&sourc 
e=g> 

New York, NY 1=022 

=CZ* 

Brice Gordon<=> 

Stanley, NM 

LSJ-GSJ, USVI 

style=> 
<=div> 
<LSJ MB Floor Plan.pdf></=> 

=span class="HOEnZb"> 
<1=> 

Brice =ordon 
=U> 

Stanley, NM <=u> 

=div> 
LSJ-GSJ, USVI 

<=span> 

4>=A0 

</=iv> 

4 

EFTA_R1_01646929 

EFTA02513672



Begin forwarded message:q=iv> 

From: Belinda Culp 

Subject: Hull For=st Products 

Date: December 19, 2017 at 2:35:22=PM EST 

sign=ture and return. 

=div style="margin:0in Oin 0.0001ptfont-size:11ptfont-family:Calibri,sa=s-serif">Hello, 
I spoke with Bella ear=ier, here is a copy of the credit card authorization document needing 

I h=ve also attached a copy of the quote reflecting that the deposit has been =ade. 

Thank you and Happy Holidays! 
<=> 

Belinda Culp, Flooring Consulta=t 

Hull For=st Products, Inc. 
=span style="font-size:9ptline-height:13.199999809265137px;font-family:84=39;Times New 

Romani,serif;color:rgb(94,128,9)">101 Hampton Road=span style="font-size:9ptline-
height:13.199999809265137px;font-family:&=39;Times New Roman',serif"> 

www.hullforest.com <http://www.hullfo=est.com/> <=> 

=/div> 

<http://www.houzz.com/pro=hullforest01/hull-forest-products> 
<=blockquote> 

=div class="m_-7643684279340197944AppleOriginalContents"> 

chttp://www.houzz.com/pro/hullforest01/hul=-forest-products> 
chttp://www.youtube.com/watch?feature=player_em=edded&v=Nfi7F8uvZw4> 

<=iv class="m_6639533392919514574WordSectionr> 

5 

EFTA_R1_01646930 
EFTA02513673



<http://www.youtube.com/watch?feature=player_embedded&=v=Nfi7F8uvZw4> 
<http://www.hull=orest.com/blogh 

<=div> 

chttp://www.hullforest.com/blogf> 
=div style="margin:Oin Oin 0.0001ptfont-size:11ptfont-family:Calibri,sa=s-serif"> 

</=iv> 

--= 

please note 

confidential, may be=attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is i=tended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE<=r>Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any =art thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have rec=ived this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
re=urn e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> 

, and 
destroy this communication an= all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights r=served 

--f403043ad6a87c77680566db97c8-- conversation-id 13364 date-last-viewed 0 date-
received 1520468208 flags 8590195713 gmail-label-ids 7 6 remote-id 802710 
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