From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, January 21, 2015 7:02 PM
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: invoice -ion nicola- jan 21, 2015
ok

On Wed, Jan 21, 2015 at 2:00 PM, Richard Kahn richardka=n12@gmail.com <mailto:richardkahnl12@gmail.com> >
wrote:

please advise if ok to pay lon for 23 days =f work totaling 6,969 + 65.65 (expenses) for total of 7,034.65
thank y=u

Richard Kahn
HBRE Associates Inc.

New York, NY 10022

Begin forwarded message:

==iv style="margin-top:0px;margin-right:0px;margin-bottom:0px;margin-left:=px">From: ion
nicola=<ionnicola@h=tmail.com <mailtozionnicola@hotmail.com= >

=o: Richard Kahn <richardkahnl12 @gmail.com <mailto:richardkahnl2@gms=il.com> >

=div style="margin-top:0px;margin-right:0px;margin-bottom: 0px;margin-left=0px">5Subject: RE:=invoice
-ion nicola- jan 21, 2015

<=div>

<f=iv=
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=C2€ please note

The information contained in this co=munication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may

c=nstitute inside information, and is intended only for

the use of the ad=ressee. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or co=ying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibitedand may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error,=please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com</=>, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,

including =l attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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