
From: ann rodriquez 
Sent: Tuesday, June 26, 2018 8:29 PM 
To: jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: Chris: Seagrape Tree pics 

will do 
DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this e-mail may=be privileged,confidential, and protected from disclosure. If 
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On Jun 26, 2018, at 11:54 AM, Ann Rodriquez wrote: 

$2,=00 (200gal.) 
$3,500-$4k (300gal.) 
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Ann R= 

On Jun 26, 2018, at 11:14 AM, jeffrey E. a 

<mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> 
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