
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, October 1, 2014 3:28 PM 
To: Lvjet; Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: GIV Mx invoice 

yes 

On Wed, Oct 1, 2014 at 11:24 AM, Lvjet «= href= > wrote: 

Jeffrey, 
may I have your approval to wire ExcellAir for our Maintenance Visit l=st week in Islip? 
Brief summary: 
Upgrade Main Door Seal Regulator =C24) $28,152.90 
New Main Batteries $2,963.75 x 2 = Q=A0 $5,927.50 
Jammed Flap actuator, re-rig Flaps =C240 2,363.50 
Engine Pylon inspection, other Engine routine due cards accomplished,.=/div> 

total invoice $52,730.32 

Thank you, 
Larry 

The informa=ion contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-cl=ent privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only=for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthori=ed use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof=is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received thiscommunication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail =r by e-mail to =eevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies=thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
<=div> 
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