
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Thursday, November 6, 2014 3:46 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: Invoice from Larry Summers to STC 

ok 

On Thu, Nov 6, 2014 at 11:44 AM, Richard Kahn 
wrote: 

attached are 4 invoices for larry summers t=ip to ny on oct 8/9 

car service 104.50 
=ar service 470.44 
hotel = 480.86 
airfare 139.88</=iv> 

total 1,195.65</=iv> 

please advise if ok to pay from stc<=div> 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

New York, NY 10022 

Begin forwarded message: 

>>> 

<=iv style="margin-top:0px;margin-right:0px;margin-bottom:0px;margin-left:=px">=b>From: Lesley =roff 
> > 

Subject: Invoice from Larry Summers to STC</=> 

Date: November 5, 2014 at 12:25:30 PM EST 

To: </=>Jeffrey Epstein &I=jeevacation@gm=il.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» 
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Cc: Bella Klein 

<=iv style="word-wrap:break-word"> 

=C24> please note 

The informat=on contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-cli=nt privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only =or 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthoriz=d use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof =s strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 

return e-mail o= by e-mail to j=evacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies =hereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
</=iv> 
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