
From: Richard Kahn < 
Sent: Friday, October 17, 2014 6:19 PM 
To: jeffrey E. 
Subject: Fwd: Terrence Quote.pdf 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates =nc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Cecile de Jongh < 

Subject: =/b>Re: Terrence =uote.pdf 

Date: =/b>October 17, 2014 at =1:05:27 AM EDT 

To: =/b>Terrence Rabsatt 
=/cliv> 
Reply-To: Cecile de longh < 

Good morning =errence, 

Can you please provide =e with proof of payment for this $100,000 invoice as well as for the =DB invoice for 
$7,057.25? Rich and Jeffrey have lost patience =ith what should be a simple thing of giving us documentation. How 
=ould you prove to the vendors that you paid if there ever is an =ssue? 

With warm =egards, 
Cecile 

On =ednesday, September 24, 2014 10:22 AM, Terrence Rabsatt < > =rote: 

Good morning, 

EFTA_R1_01652561 
EFTA02517326



Here's my invoice from =uture tech and I'll scan and send the other 2 invoices =ater. 

I will get the printouts from the =ank today as I don't have hard copies. I do all digital and didn't want =o send 
the print screen from my phone or iPad. 

Hope =his helps us move forward. 

Terrence Rabsatt 

=/div> 
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