From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com >
Sent: Monday, June 16, 2014 2:56 PM
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: i Apt 2 G renovation

yes

On Mon, Jun 16, 2014 at 10:47 AM, Richard Kahn < e,

wrote:

Attached=are photos of work along with invoice from Anthony

Please advise=if ok to pay
On Jun 11, 2014, at 3:39 PM, Anthony Barrett c-:- wrote=
Hi Rich,
Below are the charges for the renovation of the kit=hen in 2G -

Appliances Liebher refrig =C2€p 53377
=C24 Viking range SBESB0 =C2

Labor  €=AD =C2€ 55000

Ikea Cabinets =C2€@ 56150

Tiles =Cl4 €=A0 5985 | kitchen floor)
Counter Top @=A0 =C2¢ 51650
Faucet €=A0 =C2€ 5625

TOTAL 524367

<=r=Anthony

Richard Kahn
HBREK Associates Inc.

Mew York, NY 10022
tel

fax
cell
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Begin forwarded message:

<=iv style="margin-top:0px;margin-right:0px;margin-bottom:0px;margin-left:=px">=b>From: -
-

Date: June 13, 2014 at 2:38:44 PM EDT

To: Richard Kahn <richardkahn12@gmail.com <mailto:r || N - -

Sent from my iPhone

=C24¢p please note

The information containe= in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileg=d, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the a=dressee. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or c=pying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited<=r> and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, p=ease notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, =nd
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachm=nts. copyright -all rights reserved
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