
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Friday, January 10, 2014 7:07 PM 
To: Eric Roth 
Subject: Re: Carpet Proposal 

yes 

On Fri, Jan 10, 2014 at 1:31 PM, Eric Roth <ERoth@intljet=com <mailto:ERoth@intljet.com> wrote: 

Dear Jeffrey,</=pan> 

Attached is our proposal for the blue carpet. Pleas= note that there will be no labor charge for the cut, fit and 
installation=and that I am billing you for the carpet at my cost.ap> 

If you would like to move forward, please sign off and=e-mail me today. Payment will be due in full now.<=p> 

Anticipating Richard's question, here ya go: 

$ 12,281.36 =Carpet (62.66 sq yds @ $196 per sq yd) 

$ =60.00 Contact adhesive, Fire Rated Velcro</=> 

$ 480.00 Burn certification cha=ges 

$ 60.00 Federal Express =harges for burn certification 

$ =A0800.00 Expedited Freight char=es for carpet roll to NY 

$ 13,981.36=A0 Total 

P 631.737.5900 la> C 516.857.6533 <tel:516.857.6533> I eroth=intljet.com I www.int=jet.com 
chttp://twitter.com/Wintljet> <http://www.facebook.com/intljet> 

2221 Sy.ithtown Avenue, Long Island MacArthur Airport, Ronkonkoma, New York 11779a> 
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<=div> 

The information contained in this c=mmunication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the a=dressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, di=closure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictl= prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, p=ease notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, =nd 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachm=nts. copyright -all rights reserved 
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