
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Saturday, February 24, 2018 5:35 PM 
To: Russell Hernandez; Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: I.s.j tile job 

im told that only two guys went for only two days, (=C240 they had required pay for 3 men for 3 days up front ?) 
?=C24k they didnt bring or have any parts sent ahead or over. =C2* so they were not able to even start one of the 

generators?!!=C2* 

=n Fri, Feb 23, 2018 at 8:52 PM, Russell Hernandez <rhernandez@=tlanticstate.com 
<mailto wrote: 

<=iv dir="auto">No them and ac guys promised tomorrow 

Russell Hernandez 

On Feb 23, 2018, at 8:49 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevac=tion@gmail.com> wrote: 
=br> 

Did the cat=rpillar guys give a proposal ? 

On=Fri, Feb 23, 2018 at 8:45 PM Russell Hernandez 
<mailto: > =gt; wrote: 

Ok wi=l call the tile guy tomorrow 

Russell H=rnandez 

On Feb 23, 2018, at 8:4= PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com 
<mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» wrote: 

Or a different porcelain tile 
=br> 

n ri F 23, 2018 at 8:43 PM Russell=Hernandez 
<mailto wrote: 
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Let me ask in am if they will make a speci=l order for us 

Rus=ell Hernandez 

On Feb 23, 2018, =t 8:42 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com 
<mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» wrote: 

Let's see 

On Fri, Feb 23, 2018 at 8:41 PM Russell Hernandez 

=it <mailto > wrote: 

Not in the tile we left at Isj 
36x36 may be=too big for those small cottages 
<=r> 

Russell Hernandez 

On Feb 23, 2018, at 8:35 PM, j=ffrey E. <je=vacation@gmail.com 
<mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» wrote: 

<=iv> 
36by 36? 

On Fri, Feb 23, 2018 at 8:20 PM Russell Hernandez 
=/a>> wrote: 

<mailto 

<=r>Cabanas and cottages 
Tile. Replacement 
We can =et 24x24 tile as well for less than $6 a square foot material only </=iv> 

<=iv id="m_9212709368950059774m_-684803974532393238m_-
480229617386168525m_=3758335389530146644m_9212437426419872272AppleMailSignature">Russell Hernan=ez 

Begin forwarded message: 
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From: Mark Libon=ti <m 
<mailto > > 

Date: February 23, 2018 at 7:36=52 PM EST 
To: Russell < 

<mailto:rhernandez@atlantics=ate.com» 

<=r>Subject: Fwd: I.s.j tile job 

Tile demo and install proposal. =br> 

Sent =rom my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: lemmond luciano 
<mailtc »Date: February 23, 2018 at 7:25:56 PM EST 

To: 
Subject: I.s.j tile job 

<=div> 
4>=A0 =C240 FLOORS 

=/div> 

remov= all existing floor tile- (coral stone) of cabins, (cabanas) #1 # 2 U 3 an= U 
4 and place in dumpster, 1,654 sf TOTAL $ 4,135 

<=r> 
dray pack-level all floors 1,654 sf, TOTAL $ 4,135 
=br> 
install 1,654 sf of porcelain tile 18x18 on a straight=pattern with 1/8 of an inch 

joint TOTAL 9,097 

TOTAL $ 1,240 

3,7201<=div> 

TOTAL $ 1,422 

40=ACI =C240 40,=A0 POOL CABANA 

=C240remove all existing floor tile- ( coral stone) and place in dumpster,=496 sf 

dray pack-level entire=floor 496 sf, TOTAL $ 1,240 

install 496 sf =f Carrera barbel tile 18x18 or 12x12 on a straight pattern TOTAL $ 

=C24 Q=A0 STAF COTAGE 

remove all existing floor tile- in the porche, and place in dump=ter, 569 sf 
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dray pack-level e=tire floor 569sf, TOTAL $ 1,422 

tile and install=tion pattern 

install 569=sf of porcelain tile 18x18 on a straight pattern with 1/8 of an inch 
joint=C2. TOTAL $ 3,129 

=C24) 4>=A0 CABANA-EA=T 

=div id="m_9212709368950059774m_-684803974532393238m_-
480229617386168525m=-3758335389530146644m_9212437426419872272gmail-m_666623224357417352gmail-
m=1200071393555453421gmail-m_9179456066868068671gmail-m_4501386099144689773g=ail-
m_5789551058637048863gmail-:za"> remove all existing floor tile- = coral stone) and place in dumpster, 153 sf TOTAL 
$ 382 

joint TOTAL $ 841 

1 and place in dumpster, TOTAL $ 7=9 

3 and place in dumpster, TOTAL $ 570 
=div class="m_9212709368950059774m_-684803974532393238m_-

4802296173861685=5m_-3758335389530146644m_9212437426419872272gmail-m_666623224357417352gmai=-
m_1200071393555453421gmail-m_9179456066868068671gmail-m_45013860991446897=3gmail-
m_5789551058637048863gmail-aHl"> 

dray pack-level entire floor 153sf, TOTAL $ 382 

=/div> 
install 153 sf of porcelain tile 18x18 on a straight=pattern with 1/8 of an inch 

<=i> 

</=> 

40=A0 =C* BATHROOM CABANA U 1 

remove all walls and shower floor tile- =coral stone) 189 sfof cabin (cabanas) U 

40=A0 =C2* BATHROOM CABANA # 3<=div> 
remove all walls and shower floor tile- (coral s=one)152 sf of cabin (cabanas) U 

4>=A0 =C* BATHROOM CABANA-EAST 

remove all walls =nd shower floor tile- (coral stone) 132 sf of cabin (cabanas) it 
EAST=place in dumpster, TOTAL $ 495 

can not give installation price4>=A0 for bathrooms walls until I see the type of 

THE PRICES ABOVE DO NOT INCLUDE ANY TYPE =F MATERIASL 

CORAL STONE AND COPING REPAIR Will BE DONE BY THE HOUR=C*WIHICH IS 
$30 PER HR FOR HELPER AND 65 FOR INSTALER, PL=S MATERIALS 
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<=div> 

please note 

confidential, may be=attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is i=tended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE<=r>Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any =art thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have rec=ived this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
re=urn e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com 

<mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication an= all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights r=served 

=C24> please note 

The information contained in this co=munication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
c=nstitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the ad=ressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or co=ying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibitedand may be unlawful. If 

you have received this 
communication in error,=please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com</=>, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including =11 attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

please note<=r> 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential,=may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, a=d is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of<=r>JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication =r any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you h=ve received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately b= 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com 

<mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communica=ion and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all r=ghts reserved 
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please no=e 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidenti=l, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information= and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property =f 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communicati=n or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If yo= have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediatel= by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com 

<mailto:jeevacation@gmail.c=m> , and 
destroy this commun=cation and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -al= rights reserved 

please note 

Th= information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be at=orney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is inte=ded only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
=nauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any par= thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have receiv=d this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
retur= e-mail or by e-mail to conversation-id 887 date-last-viewed 0 date-

received 1519493688 flags 8590195713 gmail-label-ids 7 6 remote-id 798053 <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> 
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