
From: Russell Hernandez 
Sent: Saturday, February 24, 2018 1:45 AM 
To: jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: I.s.j tile job 

Ok will call the tile guy tomorrow 

Russell Hernandez 

On=Feb 23, 2018, at 8:44 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailtoieevacation@gmai=.com» wrote: 

On Fri, Feb 23, 2018 at 8:20 PM Russell Hernandez < > wrote: 

Cabanas and cottages 
Tile. Replacement 
<=iv>We can get 24x24 tile as well for less than $6 a square foot material on=y 

Russell Hernandez 

Begin forward=d message: 

From: Mark Libonati 
February 23, 2018 at 7:36:52 PM EST 
To: Russell < 

=blockquote type="cite"> 

Subject: Fwd: I.s.j tile job 

Tile dem= and install proposal. 

Sent from my iPhone<=div> 
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Begin forwarded message: 

From: lemmond luciano < 

Date: Feb=uary 23, 2018 at 7:25:56 PM EST 

Su=ject: I.s.j tile job 

=/div> 
<=iv class="m_-480229617386168525m_-

3758335389530146644m_921243742641987227=gmail-m_666623224357417352gmail-
m_1200071393555453421gmail-m_91794560668680=8671gmail-m_4501386099144689773gmail-ii m_-
480229617386168525m_-37583353895=0146644m_9212437426419872272gmail-m_666623224357417352gmail-
m_1200071393555=53421gmail-m_9179456066868068671gmail-m_4501386099144689773gmail-gt" id="=_-
480229617386168525m_-3758335389530146644m_9212437426419872272gmail-m_6666=3224357417352gmail-
m_1200071393555453421gmail-m_9179456066868068671gmail-m_=501386099144689773gmail-:k0"> 

&=bsp; &=bsp; FLOORS 

=nbsp;remove all existing floor tile- (coral stone) of cabins, (cabanas) #1 ft=2 # 3 and # 4 
and place in dumpster, 1,654 sf TOTAL $ 4,135 

dray pack-level all floors 1,654 sf, TOTAL $ 4,135 

install 1,654 sf of porcelain tile 18x18 on a st=aight pattern with 1/8 of an inch joint 
TOTAL 9,097 

&nbs=; &nb=p; POOL CABANA 

<=iv class="m_-480229617386168525m_-
3758335389530146644m_921243742641987227=gmail-m_666623224357417352gmail-
m_1200071393555453421gmail-m_91794560668680=8671gmail-m_4501386099144689773gmail-
m_5789551058637048863gmail-aHl"> 

</=iv> 
&nbs=;remove all existing floor tile- ( coral stone) and place in dumpster, 496 s= TOTAL 

$1,240 

dray pack-level entire floor 4=6 sf, TOTAL $ 1,240 

install 496 sf of Carrer= barbel tile 18x18 or 12x12 on a straight pattern TOTAL $ 3,7201 
=br> 

&nbs=; STAF COTAGE 

remove all existing f=oor tile- in the porche, and place in dumpster, 569 sf TOTAL $ 
1,422<=div> 

dray pack-level entire floor 569sf, TOTAL $ 1,422</=iv> 
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install 569 sf of porcelain tile 18x18 on a st=aight pattern with 1/8 of an inch joint 
TOTAL $ 3,129 

<=div> 
&nb=p; &n=sp; CABANA-EAST 

remove all exi=ting floor tile- ( coral stone) and place in dumpster, 153 sf TOTAL $=382 

dray pack-level entire floor 153sf, TOTAL $ 38= 

install 153 sf of porcelain tile 18x18 = on a straight pattern with 1/8 of an inch joint 
TOTAL $ 841 

&=bsp; &=bsp; BATHROOM CABANA # 1 

remove all =alls and shower floor tile- (coral stone) 189 sfof cabin (cabanas) # 1=and 
place in dumpster, TOTAL $ 709 

&=bsp; &=bsp; BATHROOM=CABANA # 3 
remove all walls and shower floor tile- (coral stone=152 sf of cabin (cabanas) # 3 and 

place in dumpster, TOTAL $ 570 

<=iv class="m_-480229617386168525m_-
3758335389530146644m_921243742641987227=gmail-m_666623224357417352gmail-
m_1200071393555453421gmail-m_91794560668680=8671gmail-m_4501386099144689773gmail-
m_5789551058637048863gmail-aHl"> = &nbs=; BATHROOM CABANA-EAST 

remove all walls and shower&=bsp; floor tile- (coral stone) 132 sf of cabin (cabanas) # 
EAST place in du=pster, TOTAL $ 495 

can not give installation price&n=sp; for bathrooms walls until I see the type of tile and 
install=tion pattern 

THE PRICES ABOVE DO NOT INCLUDE ANY TYPE OF MATERIASL 

please note 

The inform=tion contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-cl=ent privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only f=r 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized=use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is s=rictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
comm=nication in error, please notify us immediately by 
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return e-mail or by e=mail to jeevacat=on@gmail.com <mailtoieevacation@gmail,com> 
, and 

destroy this communication and all copies thereof,=br>including all attachments. 
copyright -all rights reserved 

=nbsp; please note 

The informati=n contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-clien= privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for=br>the use of the addressee. It is 

the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized u=e, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is st=ictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
commu=ication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-=ail to jeevacati=n@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , 

and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,<=r>including all attachments. 

copyright -all rights reserved 

=/div> 
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