From: Richard Kahn <W
Sent: Wednesday, June 2/, 2018 10:4

To: jeffrey E.

Subject: Re: LS) MM Boat

paul sales today were as follows:

MSFT sold 5200 @ 99.56

EQIX sold 1200 @ 430.03

BAC sold 7500 @ =8.7514

51300 =PY 7/20/2018 280 C @ 0.50 {cost 0.46 with commission in and =ut)

Southern Trust sells 20mm notional SPX Sep 2800 call with =ontinuous KO @ 2950 for 5152,361 (cost 96,000)

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 =exington Avenue 4th Floor
Mew York, NY 10022

On Jun 27, 2018, at 6:33 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote:

it ws run on the rocks. easy. throw =way keep what we can. i have asked paul for the prices he sold at =

On Wed, Jun 27, 2018 at 6:31 PM, Richard Kahn =span dir="Itr" classz'“':-_ wrote:

attached is survey when we =urchased which says wetted surfaces were not observed..

Richard Kahn
HBREK Associates Inc.
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575 =exington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

Begin forwarded message:

Subject: =/b=Re: LSJ MM =opat

Date: =/b>June 27, 2018 at 6:13:45 PM EDT

Rich

attached for your Reference photo's, G5J =oat Ceniza

Obwiously the Hull has =elaminated,

Have requested a survey for insurance =roposes, is there any other information you or the
insurance company =ay need.

Obviously we will start looking for a =eplacement Boat

regards Brice

On Wed, =un 27, 2018 at 12:52 PM, brice gordon <{ | GTcNGE

Attached=photo's for your repair

Ceniza was salvage by =bove and Below this morning and is now being towed to Tropical
=arina.

It =ppeared at first the Drain Plug in the Hull had failed, but this is not =he case

The =lug was replaced and the Boat is still taking on Water. The bilge pump =as
repaired, to allow the boat to be towed to Tropical Marina for =nspection.

It appears the hull is =elaminating.!!

Once We have confirmed =etail on cause, | will forward.
regards

Brice =ordon
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The Saint James =roup
LSV

Brice =ordon
The Saint James =roup
U5l

please note

The information contained in this =ommunication is
confidential, may be attorney-client =rivileged, may
constitute inside information, and is =ntended only for
the use of the addressee, It is the =roperty of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure =r copying of this
communication or any part thereof is =trictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have =eceived this
communication in error, please notify us =mmediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and
destroy this =ommunication and all copies thereof,
including all =ttachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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