
From: Melanie Spinella 
Sent: Thursday, February 15, 2018 5:32 PM 
To: jeffrey E.*; Brad S Karp 
Subject: RE: [External] 

Hi Brad-- hi Jeffrey 

For your information I basically disagree with just about everything in this memo other than the first sentence. Happy to 
discuss all when we do meet. 

From: jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com] 
Sent: Thursday, February 15, 2018 12:07 PM 
To: Brad S Karp < >; Melanie Spinella 
Subject: [External] 

IBrad, leon said that he has been waiting for over a year for me or you to set a meeting. he said that he discussed with 
you and you agreed that his payment amount was the right one. ( He also acknowledges that you were not told of the 
agreement re percentage of savings. ) He bellives that having to wait to deduct the fees. should be taken into 
consideration. and that I agreed , that and no more work would be done. and posits that no work was done .separate 
from tails of past deals. . . I have offered with a sense of fairness between friends. to pay him the money back and like 
in any other dispute, rescind the benefits . leon if i have not described your views properly please respond 

please note 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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EFTA_R1_01666845 
EFTA02526561


