From: Richard Kahn <[ -

Sent: Saturday, February 10, 2018 &:13 PM
To: Jeffrey Epstein
Subject: Fwd: Generator Payment

Confirming ok to proceed as originally quot=d for 3 days and 3 men.

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 L=xington Avenue, 4th Floor
New York,=NY 10022

Phone
Fax
Cell

Begin forwarded message:=br>

From: [N <<= href="mailto [ - -

=ate: February 10, 2018 at 1:00:29 PM EST
To: Russell Hernande= <
Cc: Richard Kahn <

Subject: Re: Generator Payment

Rich

even though this is a premium cost for this service, Russell and=| agree its best to get a second opinion from an
Authorized company, =nbsp; before pr=ceeding with the over haul of the Generators.

Can please advise which CC we can use for aut=orization of Service. We would like to process out today, as we maybe
able t= get Rimco on site next week.

any concerns let me know.

regards

On Sat, Feb 10, 2018 at 8:18 AM, Russell Her=ande:z <[ GG
<mailto | - - «rote:

Hi -jeffreyr tells me h= okd this a while back?
<=r>Russell Hernandez
L=

=n Feb 10, 2018, at 7:15 Av, | NN < < - - o=
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Good morning Russell
sorry this was se=t - email by mistake

Confirming you are ok with propo=ed pricing and proposed time for inspection.

Please advise
<=iv>Regards -

Begin forwarded message:

From: LsJ 65, <[ <o S, - -+

Date: February 9, 2018 at 8:06:47 PM AST

Subject: Fwd: Generator Payment=br>

Sent from my iPhone

From:=/b> Mark Libonati </ <. i+ -

=
Date: February 9, 2=18 at 11:21:54 AM GMT-4
To: =/a=>
Ce: <mailto

<mailto >

Subject: Generator Payment

Hope all i= well!

We have CAT technicians set up to v=sit for the 3 day full analysis inspection of the 2
generators, Feb 19th th=u the 23rd.

We need to send CAT the the C= authorization back as soon as possible to keep the
above Dates. The Sooner=the better due to Hurricane Maria. We don’t want to loose the dates=

If you can, please let us know when paym=nt is sent, so we can follow up with CAT to

confirm dates above remain,.

Thank you
M=rk

Sent from my iPhone
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<f=pan>

Sent from my iPhone
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