From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com=>

Sent: Friday, October 23, 2009 3:07 PM
To: Richard Kahn
Subject: Re: Fw: FANCELLI EURO PAYMENT

50% of the 45k

On Fri, Oct 23, 2009 at 1=:45 AM, Richard Kahn <|J N <~ -+ N -

> wrote:

please advise

--- On Thu, 10/22/09, Andre Sattaur <[ G- v ot-:

From: Andre Sattaur < <o S - -

Subject: FANCELLI EURO P=YMENT
To:
Cc: "Allison Brantley” <
Date: Thurs=ay, October 22, 2009, 5:49 PM

Hi Good Even=ng Rich,
<=p>

Just wanted =o let you know that we received a Euro payment in the amount of 22,500.00 Euros. We wanted t=
know how you computed to make a deposit of 22,500.00 Euros. It is an odd figu=e.

£=p>
Thxe/=>
Andre=/p=>

{:p}
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The information contained in this communication is confidentia=, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the a=dressee. It is the property of Jeffrey Epstein Unauthorized
use, di=closure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictl= prohibited and may be unlawful. If you
have received this communication in error, p=ease notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to
jeevacation@gmail.com, and destroy thi= communication and all copies thereof, including all attachments.
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