From: brice gordon |

Sent: Thursday, June 28, 2018 1:30 PM
To: jeffrey E.

Subject: Re: LS) Nana Refurbishment

Got it

Thank you

Sent from my iPhone

On Jun 28, 2018, at 7=57 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@=mail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> > wrote:

Wait until 10th

On Thu, Jun 28, 2018 at 7:10 AM brice gordon _ wrote:

</[=iv=>
Good Morning</=pan>
Refurbishment of Nana

Can we send Nana to BV for Topside Pa=nt etc First,
Then have tubes removed for fabrication.
Whilst the Tub=s are away, Carlos and Randy will continue with Refit of Cabin House,
=div class="gmail_default" style="font-size:13.33px;font-variant-ligatur=s:normal;font-variant-east-
asian:normal;background-color:transparent”>
<=div>
=font color="#000000">Paint Topside, water sand bottom and polish, BVI $75=0.00, plus haulage,
10days for work.
Off Shore (V1) $19,992.00, tubes removed, shipped FL fo= fabrication
(3 weeks) plus
5 days for install= 3 days to cure,
Color of Tube as per Existing

Can we proceed?

regards
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Brice Gordon
The Saint J=mes Group
sV

Ph: (340) 201 9533

&=bsp; please note

The information contained in this comms=nication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
cons=itute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addres=ee, It is the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying=of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and m=y be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please n=tify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:j=evacation@gmail.com>, and
de=troy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachment=. copyright -all rights reserved
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